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THE PRESIDENT’S MESSAGE 
 

As most of you probably know by now, we are 
rebuilding our Vietnam Triple Deuce, Inc. web-
site.  I would like to introduce you to a friend of 
mine, Harold Metcalf, Portland OR.  who is a 
real-deal computer programmer/analyst that has 
agreed to help us out in making our website as 
good as we all want it to be, as well as updated 
and changed as the membership need in the 
future changes.  Harold is honored to help us 
out, being a supporter of Veterans his whole life, 
and being raised by WWII Veteran of the Pacific 
Theater, he is more than happy to helps us out. 
Harold was the one of the people that helped 
me to develop the ORA, in particular, the certifi-
cate back in 2003. 

 

Thank you so much for your help Harold, wear 
your Order of the Red Ant with pride, you 
earned it, and will earn it again and again with 
your future help and advice with our website. 

 

I recently returned from our annual Charlie Boat 
Original mini-reunion in Chehalis/ Centralia 
WA., and was reminded, as I always am after 
reunions, what a diverse group  we are.  We are 
so different from one another, yet the same in 
our Soldiers Heart.  I believe that we all must be 
reminded of that fact from time to time.  I cer-
tainly do.  I forget constantly that I am not the 
only one going through the things that we all go 
through.  The bad memories, the aches and 
pains, the guilt…  Maybe that‟s another reason 
to attend reunions, to be reminded of our differ-
ences, as well as our camaraderie and good 
times together. 
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We are a moody lot when you get right down to 
it.  Care must be taken with sensitive subjects 
that are really out of our hands anyway.  We 
need to concentrate on our mission of finding our 
long lost Brothers and promoting our society, in-
stead of carrying the world‟s problems, politics, 
and morals on our shoulders.  Let‟s deal with our 
own issues, and show the world how a society 
can accomplish goals for the good of all, and be-
come a positive force in our lives through our 
Deeds, not Words. We can be an example of 
how well people can work together even when 
they originate from different backgrounds and 
core beliefs.  
 
I want to take this opportunity to encourage our 
members to contribute to the 22nd Infantry Regi-
ment Society‟s goal of raising enough money to 
produce a memorial to all 22nd IR soldiers who 
lost their lives defending our nation throughout 
our history.  We know a lot of guys that will have 
their names on that monument.  We owe it to 
them to be honored forever at The Infantry Mu-
seum in Fort Benning GA., where the monument 
will stand as long as there is a U.S.A. Our fallen 
Brothers will never be forgotten.  This memorial 
will stand for that goal.  
 
Thank you all again for your trust in me as your 
President, and for voting in a great group of Di-
rectors that I depend on very much. We are all 
dedicated to our mission, and to you, our valued 
members. 

 

Lynn W. Dalpez, D.M.O.R. 
                                     President, VN222, Inc  
 

EDITOR’S COMMENTS 
 
It has been a long HOT summer in Kansas.  
Heat records have been shattered.  The garden 
produce came with much effort (weeding in the 
heat, watering, gathering and processing) but it 
will be well worth the effort when we enjoy the 
produce this winter. Similarly that is where we 
are with The Triple Deuce.  Contacts are being 

made, phone calls and e-mails exchanged, and 
Brothers brought home to the organization.  
Finding our Brothers is the greatest task of the 
members.  Only when we are united can we 
serve each other and keep the organization vital.  
Anyway that is how it seems to me. 
 

                                                                                                       
Dan Streit D/69 

 

 
HOLT PLEDGES  

A MILLION DOLLARS  
 

Peter Holt, owner & CEO of Holt Industries and 
the San Antonio Spurs, has made a challenge 
gift to match up to $1,000,000 in donations to the 
Education Center at the Viet Nam Wall in Wash-
ington D.C.   
 
After a visit back to 'Nam last year Holt was in-
spired to help get the center done. (Holt served 
with Alpha Company, Triple Deuce in 1967) The 
goal at the center is to display the names of all 
58,267 on The Wall at THE LEGACY OF SER-
VICE along with stories behind the names.  In 
Holt's words,  " We don't want America to re-
member these brave men and women as simply 
fighting and dying in Vietnam. We want people to 
know that these heroes were someone's family 
and friend too!" 
 
The Education Center is scheduled to have 
planned exhibits (at the COLLECTION WALL) of 
the thousands of items that have been left by 
loved ones to honor the names on The Wall. In 
addition, there will be a WALL OF FACES of the 
fallen and a photographic timeline featuring key 
dates of the Viet Nam War and creation of The 
Wall. 
 
Donation information and additional details are 
available at the VVMF website www.VVMF.org 
 

Lon Oakley A/69 

Vice President Triple Deuce  
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“NIGHT OWL” 
a series of excerpts from letters home 

by Karl "DOC" Bergeron 
   

 
November 27, 1966 

I am greatly sorry that I haven‟t written for such a 
long time.  My time for at least the last seven 
days has been distributed strictly between night 
patrols and company size operations during the 
day. 
 
To be truthful, any spare time I have I sleep.  I 
am always tired…It wouldn‟t be so bad if I didn‟t 
have to go on every patrol the platoon sends out, 
but I do.  I‟m the only Medic in the platoon and 
each night a different squad goes out on patrol.  
I‟ve adopted the name of “Night Owl”.  Naturally 
in civilian life most of my activity was at night, but 
those were completely different circumstances. 
 
Not only haven‟t I been able to write, I haven‟t 
read my mail in seven days either…I‟ve come to 
a conclusion.  If I could get out of the damn in-
fantry and work in a MASH unit I would extend 
my tour here for six months.  That means I would 
get out of the Army three months later than 
scheduled, but I would live a somewhat normal 
life.  Whatever that is.  Clearly the night patrols 
are getting on my nerves.  Moreover, gaining the 
experience I would get in a MASH unit would be 
helpful in terms of gaining acceptance into 
Dukes Physicians Assistants program. 
 
I have to close for now and get some sleep. . .I 
can hardly keep my eyes open. . .Have to go out 
and tame the jungle creatures later on. 
 

December 5, 1966 
 

Finally I have a chance to write a half way de-
cent letter.  It has been so long since I‟ve written 
anything.  You must think I‟ve become a mental 
midget.The letter that you received from me that 
was addressed by another person was not done 
to startle you.  I had finished the letter and be-
fore I had time to address it I was called out on 

patrol so I had a friend do it for me.  I‟m sorry if it 
caused any alarm.  I really didn‟t mean to give 
you a scare. 
 
To reassure you that I‟m okay I‟ll just say that I 
am still in one piece and basically the same old 
me. . .naturally, I‟ll change slightly during this 
years vacation in the orient, but when I return I‟ll 
still have many of my old characteristics, I hope. 
 
Yesterday, Bravo Company flew from Dau Tieng 
(our new base camp) to Bear Cat to pick up the 
remainder of our equipment and take a few days 
rest. 
 
I just returned from the PX.  They have a wide 
variety of radios, tape recorders and cameras.  I 
didn‟t but anything because I couldn‟t figure out 
where I would use them being in the field most of 
the time. 
 
There really is quite a bit to write about.  We‟ve 
been on the move most of the time and seen a 
considerable amount of this area of Viet Nam, 
especially the region close to the Cambodian 
border.  Now we are back away from the border.  
Although we are still attached to the 25th Infantry 
Division we are no longer on Operation Attle-
boro. 
 
I „m going to cut this letter short and write to M‟s 
brother, Bob who is stationed near Danang with 
the Marines.  He wrote me a while back and this 
is the first opportunity I‟ve had to get back to 
him.  His unit just returned from the DMZ.  From 
what he revealed in the letter he‟s had a rough 
time the nine months he‟s been in country. 
 
I know one thing, I am glad we‟re not any further 
North than we are.   It is bad enough just being 
here in the Infantry without going into the areas 
where combat is almost guaranteed on a daily 
basis.  I know we‟ve only been here a short time 
compared to many other units, but I‟ve already 
seen more than I wish to see.  It wouldn‟t hurt 
my feelings one iota if I never heard another shot 
fired, or if I never ventured out on another night 
patrol. 
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Well, rest is over. . .a friend just informed me 
that we‟ll be going on patrol tonight.  That cer-
tainly puts me in a different frame of mind. . .we 
are also scheduled to go out again tomorrow af-
ternoon. . .some body fed us a bunch of bull shit 
before coming back to this miscarriage of a base 
camp. . .REST HELL!!!!!!!! 
 
 

December 9, 1966 
 
I just finished writing to my folks and the Ray-
crafts in Norwich, Vermont.  I didn‟t go on patrol 
last night and we didn‟t go out on operations to-
day….one night and one day of rest. . .it feels 
good. 
 
As usual the rest period doesn‟t last very long.  
Tonight the whole Company along with Alpha 
Company will move out on foot to surround a 
certain village just North of Dau Tieng.  Our mis-
sion is to prevent Charlie from collecting taxes 
which he apparently does on or around the tenth 
of each month.  Additionally, our mission will be 
to collect Charlie. . .more blood shed on Viet 
Nam soil is inevitable.  War is truly an exercise in 
STUPIDITY. ..Have I said that before? 
 
Two weeks ago we returned to Dau Tieng from 
Bear Cat.  We arrive back around 9:00 a.m.  Be-
fore one that afternoon we were on the move 
again.  Our Recon platoon had made contact 
with an unknown number of Viet Cong.  Bravo 
Company was sent in case they were needed.  
Fortunately we weren‟t needed.  With Recon in 
the lead, on point of the convoy, we headed 
back to camp. 
 
About three miles from base camp the third track 
in the column hit a mine.  When I arrived at the 
scene everything was in utter chaos.  The track 
was upside down and facing the opposite direc-
tion it had been travelling in.  Five men were in-
jured and two others couldn‟t be reached until 
the APC was up-righted.  The five MIAs had a 
variety of wounds ranging from burns to frac-
tured limbs, and a few broken ribs.  The two be-
neath the track included the platoon leader, Lt. 

Murphy, and their medic Will Lambert.  Bill and I 
had been together since basic training.  We were 
at Ft. Sam and Camp Irwin together. . .it was 
very stressful for all of us. 
 
Although everyone worked hard to get the track 
upright it took a long time to get to the two men 
pinned underneath.  When the track was finally 
lifted off them and we were able to get to them it 
was clear there wasn‟t much that we could do for 
them.  Both men had been crushed to death.  
The Lt.‟s chest was completely caved in.  Bill‟s 
body from the waist down had no rigidity to it.  
He had to be lifted onto a poncho by his armored 
vest.  His legs were not sturdy enough to enable 
anyone to lift him by them.  It was horribly grue-
some. 
 
The sad part is that Shorty and Bill are from the 
same small town.  There are three others in our 
unit from the same place.  I can only imagine 
how scared these other families will be when 
they hear about Bill‟s death. 
 
We spent the night in the area.  In the morning 
the remainder of the APC was destroyed and we 
returned to base, deeply saddened and tired.   
 
Each time a track is hit by a mine and is no 
longer functioning we make sure it will never be 
operational again.  Obviously this is done to pre-
vent the Cong from using it for any reason; as a 
bunker or for parts that he could use against us. 
 
I know I‟ve mentioned this before, but I think it 
would be good to bring it up again.  I am seri-
ously considering extending my tour here for an-
other six months.  I would do this only if I can 
work in a hospital.  I have numerous reasons for 
contemplating this, but I‟d rather not go into them 
at this moment.  I just want you to be expecting it 
and not be too disappointed if I do.  Eventually, if 
it does happen I‟ll explain why then. 

 
 
 
 
 



 5 

 

December 15, 1966 

 
Once again we are on the move.  We‟ve been 
told we‟ll be out for three days.  We left our 
base camp yesterday around two in the after-
noon and headed north.  We were held up 
twice enroute to our area of operations by 
sniper fire.  Fortunately no one in our unit was 
wounded.  However, we did capture one 
wounded VC. 
 
We arrived at the location we‟ll be in around 
7:00 pm just before dark.  At eight I was 
scheduled to go on patrol.  At 7:45 I casually 
stepped off the ramp of the track and sprained 
my ankle.  Because I was unable to walk prop-
erly another medic filled in for me.  Remember 
the time I sprained my ankle running to the car 
in the rain?  Those were the “good ole days.” 
 
Today we‟re on a search and clear mission.  
I‟m not with the first platoon.  Because of my 
ankle I‟m riding in the Aid Track that travels 
with our company.  They wanted to send me 
back to base camp, but I elected to stay here.  
Even with a bum ankle I can help if anything 
happens. 
 
Did I tell you that the 1st Platoon has a new 
platoon leader?  Well, about a week ago Lt. 
Pryor was transferred to a higher position at 
Battalion Headquarters and we got a new Lt.  
He is young and very inexperienced.  He‟s 
only been in country a couple of weeks so he‟ll 
have to learn the ropes from us.  So far he 
hasn‟t had to react under fire.  Everyone is 
wondering how he will do.  There will never be 
another Lt. Pryor.  He was a bit jumpy at times, 
but under pressure he always remained calm 
and collected.  We all miss him, but I know 
he‟ll do a good job wherever he is.  We were 
lucky to have had him with us for as long as 
we did. 
 
For the first time I can say that my morale is a 
little low.  Each day the toll of our experience 
here mounts up.  Last week, as I told you, we 
lost a platoon leader and his medic.  Three 

days ago the 2nd Platoon returning from a night 
ambush patrol was hit by a series of land mines.  
Four men were wounded and one was killed.  
Their Medic, a German kid from Wisconsin, was 
quite busy until the Med-Evac arrived. 
 
When I first saw him after they returned I real-
ized that he was really shaken up.  It was like he 
was in shock, rattled to the core.  I went to the 
Aid Station and suggested to our Platoon Sgt. 
that the medic should go on a three day pass to 
get some rest and his head cleared.  He‟s on 
pass now.  I hope it helps.  Maybe I‟ll suggest 
that I go on pass one of these days. 
 

I sincerely hope you have a wonderful Christ-
mas.  Give my love to everyone. 
 

HARVEY NALL’S ACCOUNT  
of October 12, 1966 

 
Harvey writes, "The article by Karl "DOC" 
Bergeron was a very good account of the 2-11 

arrival in Vietnam.  My arrival to Vietnam on Oc-
tober 12, 1966 was with the Recon Platoon.  We 
fell into formation with steel pot, LBE & duffel 
bag.  I did not have a steel pot.  My steel pot 
and .45 holster had been stolen some time in 
early October 1966.  My Platoon Leader said no 
one will leave the ship without a steel pot!!  Only 
thing to do was requisition one with out doing 
the paperwork!!  So, I started back thru the ship 
to find a loose steel pot.  It did not take long to 
find a steel pot.  The pot I found belonged to a 
Lieutenant, but it did not matter to me as I now 
had a steel pot and could make the beach land-
ing with the Recon Platoon.  I know some sol-
diers had to be missing a steel pot when they 
left the ship but I am thankful to this day that it 
was not me.   
 

                                                                                  
Harvey Nall, Jr. 

                                            336-963-1125                                      
                                        HHQ, Recon 

                                            Dec. 65 to Sept.67                                       
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    FLAGS PLACED AT 
MT. KILIMANJARO 

 
My name is Jim Neeley (C/2/22 4th & 25th Div. 
VN 66'-67') and I have some info you might want 
to use in your newspaper. Nathan Hen-
wood, who is co-webmaster of our "Charlie 

Company" website www.originalboatpeople.com 
has Parkinson Disease and has climbed Mt. Kili-
manjaro with a group of other climbers that also 
has Parkinson's or MS. He offered to take our 
Charlie Company Gideon and the 22nd Infantry 
Regiment Battalion flags to the Summit of Mt. 
Kilimanjaro. . 
 
I feel it was a "Great Honor" for Charlie Com-
pany, the 22nd Regiment Society, the 25th & the 
4th Divisions, that he took this upon himself to 
carry these flags to Tanzania, Africa, and then to 
the Summit in Honor of the men in these units! 
  

Jim Neeley 
C Co. 4th & 25th, 66 to 67 

 
                                                                        
 
 
 
 
 
 

         THE INSIDE TRACK 
 

Atlanta Reunion 2011 
A heartfelt Thank You!  to Bob Babcock, 1/22, 
Reunion Chair, and Skip Fahel, 2/22, President 
of the 22nd Infantry Regiment Society, for putting 
on a terrific reunion in Atlanta GA.  I had a blast, 
and hated that it had to end…at least until Colo-
rado Springs in 2012, our next reunion stop.  As 
far as I am concerned, these reunions just keep 
going on with some delay between locations that 
we visit. 

 

Visiting The National Infantry Museum, Fort Ben-
ning, GA.  was well beyond my expectations.  It 
sure felt nice being there with a C.I.B. on my 
chest (My hat, actually, but you get the idea.)  
It‟s our museum—Combat Infantrymen.  Those 
that missed it must see it one day.  Once you 
walk in the main entrance of the large, beautiful 
building and see a huge monolith with a giant 
C.I.B. on it, you know you are home. 

 

Many of you know my personal highlight of the 
reunion, that being awarded the Distinguished 
Member of the Regiment.  My humble thank you 
to the Officers and Directors of the 22nd IRS for 
making it happen for me.  My promise to the 
members and our active duty 22nd IR soldiers in 
return, is to try my best to live up to the honor, 
and never forget our motto “Deeds, not Words.”   
I was furthered honored to receive the award 
along with John Bradley 2/22, LTC (ret.) Mark 
Woempner 1/22, and Ms. Phyllis  Engel 
Worthman, who received the Honorary Member 
of the Regiment award. (I think Phyllis was a Drill 
Sergeant or something.)  Great company to find 
oneself in to be sure. 

 

I was further honored to be elected as the Presi-
dent of the Vietnam Triple Deuce, Inc.   My fist 
act of business was to drop all VN222er‟s who 
made this possible for 20 pushups.  They should 
be done with them by Christmas time. 

http://www.originalboatpeople.com/
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Excellent hotel choice Bob.  Free cooked to or-
der breakfast, and a happy hour in the bar that 
was indeed happy.  The staff treated us with the 
upmost of care and professionalism.   
 
We are very fortunate have  COL. (ret.) Ed 
Schultz, 2/22, as our Honorary Colonel of the 

Regiment.  His name was always brought up 
when members discussed who should be our 
next Honorary Colonel.  Looks like we all got our 
wish.  Ed was, and is, a soldier‟s officer of the 
highest caliber.  

 

The Website 
 

As most of you know by now, we are revamping 
our website.   We have a team working on it 
now, and in the future, which will allow us to up-
grade, edit, and, and add new information 
quickly and accurately.  Our goal is to make a 
website that tells our story, as well as attracts 
new members to join us.  So, keep checking the 
site and send us your thoughts and suggestions. 
A Special thank you to Harold Metcalf, Pro-
grammer, Steve Irvine, Visuals and technical 
advice, and our Board of Directors, Manage-
ment. 

 

Charlie Boat Originals Mini-reunion 
 

Once again we held our annual CBO mini-
reunion in the Centralia/Chehalis WA area.  Our 
host, Jim Neely did a great job of setting things 
up for us at the American Legion Hall in Cen-
tralia for our banquet.  The star attraction was a 
talk given by our Honorary Company Com-
mander, George C. White III.  Every time 

George talks about The Battle of Soui Tre, Mar. 
21, 1967, more pieces fall into place for us about 
what happened that day. George brought along 
some great slides, and maps, that his lovely wife 
Patti helped him put together.  George had the 
members spellbound throughout his presenta-
tion. One thing is for sure—we kicked some seri-
ous behind that day. 

Colorado Springs 
 22nd IRS Reunion, 2012 

 

LTC (Ret.) Mark Woempner will Chair the next 
22nd IRS reunion and promises a fabulous time 
for all who attend.  For those that don‟t know 
Mark, he is definitely a leader that keeps his 
promises.  He was, and is, a soldier‟s officer, 
and a hell of a lot of fun to be around.  Mark‟s 
energy and commitment to the 22nd IRS and its 
members will ensure a good time for all.  So, 
mark your calendars and plan on attending.  
Those of you that will be attending a 22nd IRS 
Reunion for the first time will find camaraderie 
with members from the WWII era, Vietnam, Iraq, 
Afghanistan, and will meet active duty 22nd IR 
soldiers.  The history of our crack Infantry Regi-
ment will be in full display.  It will be easy for you 
to see how important the Triple Deuce‟s contri-
bution was to that storied history. Details can be 
found on our website, as well as 
www.22ndinfantry.org.  Don‟t miss it.  You will 
have no regrets by attending. 

 

That‟s it for this time around.  Thank you mem-
bers for your support with our Triple Deuce 
cause. 

 

Deeds, not Words. 

 

Lynn William Dalpez, D.M.O.R. 

President 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

http://www.22ndinfantry.org/
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KIAs List as of  9-11 

2nd Battalion, 22nd 

 Infantry Regiment 
Submitted by Brad Hull 

 
Alpha Company 
Larry Allen Rice 11/04/66 
John Francis McCabe 11/22/66 
Jesse Rice 01/16/67 
David Dennis Berkholz 
 WIA 01/29/67 01/31/67 
Edward Earl Schell 02/06/67 
Arthur Clarence Sisco Jr 
 WIA 02/06/67 02/27/67 
Dennis John Breda 03/19/67 

Doc Bruce Anthony Corcoran  
     Attached from HHC 03/19/67 
Barney Joe Kelly 03/19/67 
Russell Lee Root 03/19/67 
James C Tarkenton III 03/19/67 
Joe Edward Mathew Amato 03/21/67 
Alan Wayne Andrews 03/22/67 
Charles Eugene Fletcher 03/22/67 
Skip Charles Harry Haber Jr 03/22/67 
Erik Bernard Wickenberg   Basic in C 
     Died in E 2nd/60th 9th Div 07/06/67 
Terry Dane Alsup 
     Also Served in 4th/23rd Mech07/15/67 
John Patrick Collopy 07/15/67 
George Alfred Holladay 07/15/67 
Alfred Frederick Alvarado 09/04/67 
Earl Russell Cobb 09/04/67 
Michael David De Camp 09/04/67 
William Eugene Hargrove 09/05/67 
Fred Kaimi Naauao Kama    WIA 09/04/67 
    Also Served in C 3/22 09/06/67 
Lawrence Adam Wojcik 10/14/67 
Clayton Arthur Martin 
 WIA 09/04/67 10/16/67 
Frenchy Gilbert Thomas Beaupre10/25/67 
Rodger Kenneth Cain 11/21/67 
Floyd Allan Hyder 11/21/67 
Michael Bradley Paquin 12/15/67 
Stephen John Whipple 12/15/67 
Thomas Beeb Chambers 12/16/67 
Edward L Clemmon 12/18/67 
Hopson CovingtonWIA 12/15/67 12/29/67 
Freddie Andray Blackburn 01/08/68 
Phelon Herman Cole 01/08/68 
Robert Risley Fryer 01/26/68 
Larry Douglas King 
     Also Served in D 3/22 02/04/68 
Bonnie Lee Coleman 02/09/68 

James Thomas Davis 02/15/68 
 
Lester Freeman 02/15/68 
Clyde Richard McAfee 02/15/68 
Mural McDaniel 02/15/68 
Richard Lee Bosworth     *DSC*02/16/68 
Robert S Hutchinson II    *DSC* 02/16/68 
Jerome Richard Kelly 02/16/68 
Roger Dale Pyne 02/16/68 
Earl H Hills 03/06/68 
Glenn Sullivan 03/06/68 
Warren Martin Beaumont 04/12/68 
Cornball Russell Hubard Cornish04/12/68 
Gary R Holland 04/12/68 
Rich Richard Allen Estrada 04/13/68 

Doc Gerald Crawford Mull  
     Attached from HHC 04/13/68 
Richie Richard Peguero 04/13/68 
Wayne A Rhodes 04/13/68 
Stanley Spikes 
 Also Served in D 3/22  04/13/68 
Dennis James Yetmar 04/13/68 
Thomas Harold Bailey 05/06/68 
Jay Alan Cook 05/06/68 
George Coleman     Also S-2 in HHC  
     Died in D Co 125th Signal Bn  05/13/68 
James Donald Hess 05/13/68 
James Edward Mays 05/13/68 
Patrick Victor McNearney 05/13/68 
Joseph Angel Mena 05/13/68 
Kevin Henry Ross 05/13/68 

Doc Michael Cami Wittevrongel  
     Attached from HHC 05/13/68 
Woody Richard Dale Wood 05/13/68 
O L Midkiff 05/31/68 
Steve Julius Dockery 09/19/68 

Doc Vernon Leon Headrick  
     Attached from HHC 09/19/68 
Dennis Lee McCormick 09/19/68 
William Richard Turner Jr 09/19/68 
James Allen Hardman 11/08/68 
Philly Donald Joseph Hertrich 11/08/68 
Ernest Melvin Plattner 
Attached from 44th Scout Dog Pltn 11/08/68 
Lawrence De Witt 11/09/68 
William Gibbs Jr 11/27/68 
Joe Irvin Wood 11/27/68 
Lewis Curtis Wuestenberg 12/22/68 
James Allan Ascher 01/08/69 
Dana James Kaeberle 01/08/69 

Doc Steven Slusher  
     Attached from HHC 01/08/69 
Cluster Lee Bearfield 01/14/69 
George Lee Kellam 02/05/69 
Daniel Irizarry-Acevedo 03/08/69 
George Allen Demby 03/11/69 
John Emery Bladek 04/25/69 
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Michael Rodney Dorman 04/25/69 
Joseph Lawrence Logan Jr 05/12/69 
Marion Lora Gardner 05/13/69 
 
David Rockwell Crocker Jr 05/17/69 
Phillip Lesley MacLeod 05/17/69 
Jerry N Creasy 08/19/69 

Doc Roberto Cervantes Duenas  
     Attached from HHC 08/19/69 
John David Duncan 08/19/69 
William Michael MacKay 08/19/69 
George William Pearson Jr 08/19/69 
Gary William Lahna 09/05/69 
Raymond Bruce Thomas 09/05/69 
Raymond Robert Blossey 
   With D 65th EngineersWIA DOW 10/23/69 
Pine Kenneth Edward Heath 10/23/69 
Donald Alan Clarbour 11/06/69 
Roger John Flynn 12/18/69 
Robert Charles Housman 12/18/69 
Jimmie James Ray Muth 03/07/70 
Marvin Lee Ringoen 03/07/70 
Donald Ray Wishon 03/07/70 
James Chris Shukas 04/12/70 
Bob Robert John Zonne Jr   MIA 04/17/70 
     Died in HHC 25th Inf Div 04/20/70 
William Eugene Smith 05/26/70 
David Frank Santa-Cruz 05/30/70 
Bravo Company 
Shorty Clinnis Harrell Jackson 11/07/66 
Donald F Lekovish 12/12/66 
Raymond Albert Bizzell 01/13/67 
George Henry Haddox 01/13/67 
Henry Wayne Webster 01/13/67 
Sydney Uel Goodin 02/06/67 
Gordon William Stark 02/06/67 
Carlos Ugarte 
     Attached from 4.2" Mortars 02/06/67 
Edward Eugene Fortenberry 02/16/67 
Dale William Moore 02/19/67 
Larry Anthony Crisci 05/17/67 
Robert Mario De Dominic  05/17/67 
Lynn Carol Hayes 05/17/67 
James Richard Michael  05/17/67 
Jasper Newton Newberry Jr 05/17/67 
Andrew Jonah Short III 05/17/67 
Roger Darriel Thompson 05/17/67 
Allen Kenneth Dearden 05/18/67 
Walter Thomas Geiger    at Ft Lewis 
     Died in A 1st/35th 25th Div 05/19/67 
Hubert Joseph Fink    
     Died in A 4th/47th 9th Div  06/19/67 
Kenneth Ray Anderson    
      Died in C 4th/23rd 07/07/67 
Lee Roy Taylor   Died in C 4th/23rd07/07/67 
David Wayne Fisher 10/23/67 

Doc James Brannon Meek  

     Attached from HHC 11/28/67 
Thomas Eugene Priesthoff 12/16/67 
Dave Edward Ashford 12/19/67 
Robert Lewis Campbell 01/01/68 
Edward Kubisky 01/20/68 
 
Thomas Michael Ross 02/02/68 
Steven Paul Linna 02/04/68 
Joseph Pat Strippoli Jr 03/17/68 
David Wayne Derry 03/22/68 
Gene Tracy Covey 04/21/68 
Jose Antonio Marrero-Rios 04/21/68 
Dan Page Vannoy 05/13/68 
John Randolph Cooper Jr 06/28/68 
William Lee Harris 06/28/68 
Yancey Smith Jr 06/28/68 
George Bennie Dukes 06/30/68 
Donald Hicks 06/30/68 
Douglas Hugh Kiker 11/21/68 
Lawrence David Kutchey 11/25/68 
Rodney Birdell Yardley 11/27/68 
John Curtis Fitzwater 01/10/69 
Curtis Robert Stocklin 01/10/69 
John Michael O'Farrell 01/14/69 
Jim Merle James Martin 
 WIA 01/14/69 01/28/69 
Roger Martin Tyner 02/23/69 
Thomas Alexander Becker 03/06/69 
Carl Dennis Cain 03/06/69 
Lowell Roger Groves 03/06/69 
William Edmond Lee Hart 03/06/69 
Jerry Johnson  03/06/69 
David Glen Lovitt 03/06/69 
Clinton Lee Wheeler 03/06/69 
Kenneth Michael Frain 03/11/69 
Alvin Grimes 05/13/69 
Mark Joseph Giron 05/14/69 
John Philip Craig 06/06/69 
Robert Michael Fullmer 06/06/69 
Raymond Richard Schifrin 06/11/69 
Roger Lee Glei 07/15/69 
Donald Henry McMains Jr 08/09/69 
John Michael Davis 08/16/69 
Raymond P Miller IIWIA 09/11/69 09/21/69 
Stephen Lamont Sharp 10/18/69 
Frazier Thomas Dixon 12/03/69 

Doc Robert Eugene Romero  
     Attached from HHC 12/03/69 
Dennis Wayne Nelson DOW 02/12/70 
Kenneth Samuel Dee 03/03/70 
James Dean Johnson 03/03/70 
Alexander Frank Potas 03/17/70 
Freddy Lamar Bratton 05/30/70 
David Graham Campbell 06/02/70 
Michael Alfred Rasmusson 06/02/70 
Leszek Stanley Karsznia 08/14/70 
William H Van Gelder Jr 08/15/70 
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Charlie Company 
Joseph Cousette  
 Also Served in HHC  11/19/66 
Frank Monroe Murphy 
 Died in Recon  12/07/66 
Johnny A Chambers 01/08/67 

Douglas J Sullivan  

 
     Attached from HHC 01/08/67 
Michael Raymond Ishman 01/12/67 
Gerry Wayne Lawson 02/08/67 
Peter Barbera 02/10/67 
Mark Delane Holte 02/10/67 
Otis Lewis 02/10/67 
Merril Andrew McKillip 02/10/67 
Charles Paul Pohlman 02/10/67 
Rex Wheeler Highfill 02/12/67 
R C Perry Jr 02/13/67 
Daniel Paul Donnellan 02/18/67 
William Raymond Sanders 02/23/67 
Thomas Duane Utter 03/23/67 
Joseph Manuel Aragon 04/18/67 
Howard Jacob Rice 06/08/67 
David Alan Brileya 06/11/67 
Edward Jerome Colston 
     Attached from 2d/77th Arty 06/11/67 
Edward Roy Lukert 06/11/67 
Joel Thomas Willis 
    Also Served in 3d Bde HHC S-106/11/67 
Erik Bernard Wickenberg    Basic Trng 
     Served in A 2/22 in Vietnam 
     Died in E 2nd/60th 9th Div 07/06/67 
Larry Arthur Merrill 
     Died in C 4th/23rd Mech 09/02/67 
Jackie Edward Trosper 09/30/67 
Dennis Rex Estes 11/25/67 
John A Gibson 11/25/67 
Robert Lucian Mlynarski 11/25/67 
Robert Andrew Van Patten 
    Attached from B Btry 2d/77th Arty11/25/67 
William Carey Janes 12/20/67 

Doc Thomas G Bernardy  
      Attached from HHC 01/02/68 
Jack Wayne Miller 01/02/68 
Willie Petty Jr 01/02/68 
Anderson Linwood Ruderson 
 WIA 01/02/68 01/13/68 
Joel Kenton Brown 02/18/68 
Dan Sellman Hicks DOW 03/07/68 
David Kenneth Ditch 03/13/68 

Doc Todd Earle Swanson  
     Attached from HHC 03/13/68 
John Edward Nelson 04/13/68 
Benjamin Allen Honeycutt 05/02/68 
Andrew L Heider 05/13/68 
Ernest Lee Elliott 06/20/68 

Doc Larry Russell Kennann  

     Attached from HHC 06/20/68 
Sidney Chester Squires 06/20/68 
Preacher David Lynn Stockman 06/20/68 
Arthur Wayne Thomas DOW 06/24/68 
Ronald August Ferrel Bolt 07/01/68 
Robert Charles Dickinson 07/01/68 
Fred V Jurado 07/01/68 
William Rieves Curry 07/06/68 
Charley Vernon Stanley ** NOT on Wall ** 
 
      Died stateside of Malaria 07/07/68 
Sam Joseph Favata 07/21/68 
William Scott Watts   Died in HHC11/21/68 
William Gilbert Keeler 12/02/68 
David Vernon Adams 01/14/69 
Dwane Lonnie Adams 01/14/69 
Marvin L McCullough Jr 01/14/69 
Lyle Thomas Moore 01/14/69 
Paul Aaron Stone 01/14/69 
John Earl Warren Jr **MOH**    01/14/69 
Alton D Percival 01/28/69 
Edward Monroe Holtzman  
 WIA 01/30/68 02/11/69 
Ricardo Joseph Ortegon 03/06/69 
Phillip Ray Baily 03/11/69 
Thomas Poldino 03/11/69 
Robert Alan Banks DOW 05/09/69 
Larry Paul Jones 05/13/69 
John Charles Nelson 05/13/69 
Robert Glenn Sekva 06/11/69 
Michael Dennis Kelly 08/06/69 
Duane Alan Clefisch 08/30/69 
Ernie Lee Wallen 08/30/69 
John R Naughton Jr 11/25/69 

Jack William Pomeroy  
     Attached from HHC 11/25/69 
Dennis Michael DaughertyDOW 03/04/70 
Rabbit Harvey David Rogers Jr 04/17/70 
Gary William Britton 05/18/70 
Carwain L Herrington 05/18/70 
New York James Joseph Wilkinson Jr 
 05/18/70 
Richard Henry Keith 05/21/70 
Joseph Anthony Cerio 05/22/70 
Maximiliano Davila-Torres 05/22/70 
Norman Anthony Emineth 05/22/70 
Pedro Herring 05/22/70 
William Norman Jensen Jr 05/22/70 
Lawrence William Theis 05/22/70 
Michael Armond De Masi 
     Died in D (4.2” mortars) 07/12/70 
Delta Company (also see Recon) 
Joseph Robert Ajster 10/05/68 
Woodie Junior Dean 11/01/68 
Albert Lummis Gay Jr 11/01/68 
Daniel Charles Patterson 11/01/68 

Doc John Edwin Lutze  
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     Attached from HHC 11/08/68 
Walter Sturgeon 02/23/69 
Michael Armond De Masi   (4.2" mortars) 
     Also Served in C 07/12/70 
Thomas Francis Delano 07/27/70 

Thomas Paul Coffino  
     Attached from HHC 09/13/70 
 
Headquarters Company (also see Recon) 
Joseph Cousette Died in C  11/19/66 

Doc William David Lambert  

 

     Died with Recon 12/07/66 

Doc Douglas J Sullivan   
     Died with C  01/08/67 
Carlos Ugarte 
     Died with B 02/06/67 

Doc Ronald Grant Mottishaw  02/16/67 
Teddy Wayne Steelman 02/27/67 

Doc Bruce Anthony Corcoran  
     Died with A 03/19/67 
Larry Buford 04/18/67 
John Joseph Thomas 
      Died with D 4th/31st 196th LIB05/05/67 
Mick Michael James Beirne 05/10/67 

Doc James Brannon Meek  
     Died with B 11/28/67 
Michael Ray Rice 
     Attached from D 65th Eng 12/26/67 

Doc Thomas G Bernardy  
      Died with C 01/02/68 

Doc Todd Earle Swanson  
     Died with C 03/13/68 
Jimmy Joe Tessadri 03/25/68 

Doc Gerald Crawford Mull  
     Died with A 04/13/68 
Gary Edward Rusha DOW 04/18/68 

Doc Wayne Thomas Provencher 05/10/68 
George Coleman     Also Served in A 
   Died in D Co 125th Signal Bn   05/13/68 

Doc Michael Cami Wittevrongel  
     Died with A 05/13/68 
William Junior Tarpley 05/16/68 

Doc Larry Russell Kennann  
     Died with C 06/20/68 

Doc Vernon Leon Headrick  
     Died with A 09/19/68 

Doc John Edwin Lutze   
    Died with D 11/08/68 
William Scott Watts 
     Also served in C 11/21/68 

Doc Steven Slusher  Died with A  01/08/69 
Larry Allen Stark 03/15/69 

Doc Roberto Cervantes Duenas  
     Died with A 08/19/69 
Timothy R Miedzielec 10/11/69 

Leslie Fred Shenk 11/10/69 

Doc Jack William Pomeroy  
     Died with C 11/25/69 

Doc Robert Eugene Romero  
    Died  with B 12/03/69 

Doc Thomas Paul Coffino   
     Died with D 09/13/70 
Recon Platoon 
                  Recon in Hq Co 
Michael Gerald Peterson 10/26/66 

Doc William David Lambert  
     Attached from HHC 12/07/66 
Frank Monroe Murphy 
 
Also Served in C 12/07/66 
James Essary 01/17/67 
Edward Ralph Glenn Jr 01/17/67 
Heeb Yvon Andre Hebert 
     Also Served in A in Basic 01/17/67 
Dale Clarence Schummer 01/17/67 
Joseph Thomas Melendres 03/18/67 
Michael Francis Smith 03/18/67 
Houston Clifford Box Jr 01/02/68 
Emerson Paul Cole 03/28/68 
             Recon in Delta Co 
Brooks Michael Scrivner 12/17/68 
Marvin Dewayne Canterbury 02/23/69 
James Frederic Uttermark 02/23/69 
Rufus Newton Stevenson Jr 05/14/69 
Donald Ray Webb 03/09/70 
Milton Perez-Rivera 05/02/70 
Charles F Armentrout 05/22/70 
Orla Daniel Hammack 
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GUEST BOOK HITS 
Name: Noble Wilcox  
Location: Cayucos CA  
Email: jannnoble@aol.com  
Phone: 970-685-9933  

Comments  
Looks great and easy to use. Very sharp. :super: 
 
Name: Lynn Dalpez  
Location: Portland Oregon  
Email: dalpezc222@yahoo.com  
Phone: 503-840-4216  
Comments  
A note from the President. 
As you can see, we are making headway in re-
storing and upgrading our website. We will be 
incorporating more ideas for additional pages of 
information about us and our history in the near 
future. In the meantime, please say hello and 
tells us your thoughts.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Name: Jim Papczynski  
Location: LaPorte, In  
Email: pappy.jj@comcast.net  
Comments  
Glad the Guest Book is up and running again. 
There is a lot of information out there that needs 
to be shared to keep our history going. 
Pap Boat Original 
 

HELLOES & COMMENTS 
 
David Reese 

dave.reese9@gmail.com 
215-350-5847 
HHC, Recon Plt, Aug 67 to Aug 68 
 
Thomas E. Buck 
757-440-7722 
tebuck62@aol.com 
HHC, 25th ID, Aug. 67 to Aug. 68 
Comments: Tom writes, "Good story by Mike 
Pectol.  I was in that convoy to FSB Burt." 

 

Vance Gustafson 

503-325-2842 
vgus@pacifier.com  
B Co. 25th ID, July 70 to Dec. 70 
Comments: "I was a Bravo Company 
Medic.  The last two KIA's on the list were in my 
Company, Leszek Stanley Karsznia, 8-14-70 , 

was my squad leader, he was killed by a booby 
trap.  The last KIA, William H. Van Gelder, Jr., 8

-15-70, was killed by small arms fire." 
 
H. Scott Kirkpatrick 
860-767-1849 
hiskirkpatrick@snet.net  
HHC, 25th ID, Mar. 68 to Mar. 69 
Comments: Scott writes, "My best to all that 
were with the 'High Angle Hell,' HQC 4.2 Mor-
tars." 
 
William J. Mader 
715-387-4310 
triple_duece@tznet.com  
B Co. 25th ID, June 69 to June 70  
Comments: William writes, "I served with Joe 
Williams, and he was in my squad.  I was in the 

same fire fight on Dec 3, 1969.  Rest in Peace." 
 
Donald L. Maiberger 
580-429-8068 
fiestypapa1@yahoo.com  
A Co. 25th ID, Oct. 67 to Oct. 68 
Comments: Don writes, "Hello to anyone in the 
Maintenance Section.  I took over when Sgt 
Woods left." 
 
Jack Shishido 
831-624-8494 
jack_shishido@mcn.com  
C Co, 4th & 25ID, April. 67 to Nov 67 
 
 
Paul Steffy 
860-849-6186 
B  Co. 25th ID, April 67 to Feb. 68 
 
Comments: Paul writes, "Best wishes and 
prayers for all!" 

mailto:dave.reese9@gmail.com
mailto:tebuck62@aol.com
mailto:vgus@pacifier.com
mailto:hiskirkpatrick@snet.net
mailto:triple_duece@tznet.com
mailto:fiestypapa1@yahoo.com
mailto:jack_shishido@mcn.com
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Carl S. Yamasaki 

808-203-0910 
carlo5836@aol.com  
A Co. 25th ID, Jan. 70 to Oct. 70 
Comments: Carl would like to locate David 
Shafer and Lt Joe Yarashih. 
 
Allan L. Zwieg 
262-792-1015 
alzkyz@milwpc.com  
B Co. 25th ID, Sept. 67 to Sept. 68 
Comments: Allan writes, "During May my wife 
and I were in San Antonio for vacation and met 
with Skip Fahel for breakfast and a visit to the 
Alamo.  I was Skip's RTO from Sep to Dec. 
1967." 
 
Timothy W. Albright 
812-537-0132 
twalbrig@hotmail.com  
Recon Platoon Aug. 69 to Aug. 70 
 
Robert H. Baker 

254-939-8085 
bbaker1953@gmail.com  
A Co. 25th ID, Nov. 69 to Nov. 70 
 
 
Thomas Berg 

918-482-1202 
B Co. 4th & 25th ID, Dec. 65 to Dec. 67 
 
Jerry J. Hardy 

joswybak@iowatelecom.net  
B Co. 25th ID, 69 to 70 
Comments: Jerry would like to locate Mike Hu-
dak.  

 
Jeri M. Neal  

319-895-8171 
jmn773@gmail.com  
C Co. 25th ID, Sept. 68 to Sept. 69 
Comments: Jeri would like to locate Warren 
"Randy" Dotson and Ernie Pratt. Jeri informs 
us that Jerry "Grady" Lloyd, Charlie Co., 68-

69, passed away in September 2010 
 
 

Gerry P. Pierce 

918-371-1970 
gerry@atlasok.com  
B Co. 25th ID, Dec. 66 to Jan. 68, 4th Platoon 
 
Richard J. Plocinski 
630-254-4031 
rjplocinski@aol.com  
B Co. 25th ID, 69 to 70 
 
James Salvatore 

jsal48005@yahoo.com  
A Co. 25th ID, May 68 to Jan. 69 
 
William J. Smith “Willie” 

773-764-8986 
semajell@aol.com  
B Co. 4th ID, Dec. 65 to July 67 
Comments: Willie would like to locate Milton 
Jones, Caldwell, Roy Jones, Dillard, Ware 
and Willard Smith.  
 

Dennis H. Holt 
325-698-9694 
mampops@att.net  
A Co. 25th ID, Oct. 68 to May 69 
Comments: Dennis writes, would like to contact 
John Crawford and Steve Van Pelt, both from 
New Jersey. "Thanks to Dick Nash and Dennis 
Luis, Palooka, for sending the pictures and e-

mails.  My family got a kick out of them. 
 
William R. Lechner 
770-487-2074 
BillPTC@earthlink.net  
A Co. & HHC, 25th ID, Jan. 70 to July 70 
 
Kenneth J. Zipp 

845-781-2625 
kenzipp@yahoo.com  
C Co. 25th ID, Jan. 69 to  April 69 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:carlo5836@aol.com
mailto:alzkyz@milwpc.com
mailto:twalbrig@hotmail.com
mailto:bbaker1953@gmail.com
mailto:joswybak@iowatelecom.net
mailto:jmn773@gmail.com
mailto:gerry@atlasok.com
mailto:rjplocinski@aol.com
mailto:jsal48005@yahoo.com
mailto:semajell@aol.com
mailto:mampops@att.net
mailto:BillPTC@earthlink.net
mailto:kenzipp@yahoo.com
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NEW FINDS 
 

Noble A. Wilcox 
35 8th St. 
Cayucos, CA 93430 
970-685-9933 
jannnonble@aol.com  
A Co. 25th ID, Nov 68 to Nov 69 
 
Bill Sealy 

4651 W-130 Court 
Alsip, IL 60803 
773-229-1908 
A Co. 4th & 25th ID‟s, Oct 66 to Oct. 67 
 

Comments: Bill would like to find Don Santi.  
 
Sam H. Giliberti 
687 Maplewood Court 
Weston, FL 33327 
954-349-8542 
godfaith66@aol.com  
4th & 25th ID, B Co. Oct. 66 to Feb. 67 
 
Ronald L. Henderson 

105 Hidden Brook Trail 
Fayetteville, GA 30115 
312-623-0171 
hronald55@hotmail.com  
A Co. 25th ID, Nov. 67 to Nov. 68 
 
Comments: Ron would like to locate Ronald 
Preston and Smitty somewhere in New Jersey.  

 
Tom Lupei 

4 Shamrock Way 
Pinehurst, NC. 28374 
910-215-9459 
tlupei@yahoo.com  
C Co. 4th & 25th ID, Nov. 66 to Nov. 67 
 
 
 

 
 

 

 

TAPS 
 

Horace A. “Buck” Shoemaker 

Newnam, Ga 
B Co. 25th ID, 67 to 68 
 
My name is John Yoshikane. I served in the 

army from March 1967 to March 1969. I enjoy 
reading the Viet Nam Triple Deuce newsletters. 
   
Could you please add my dear friend's name in 
the TAPS portion of your next issue.  His name 
is Buck Shoemake of Newnan, Georgia. He 

served in B Co. 25th Infantry Division from 8/67 
to 8/68. He passed away  on February20, 2009.   

 
Thank you for the great work you do honoring 
all  the men and women that have sacrificed so 
much for our country. 
 

 

Aloha, 
John Yoshikane 

B Co. 25ID 9-67 to 9-68 
 
Henry J. Smith 

A Co. 25tg ID, 1970 
Passed away Aug. 13, 2011 
 
I don't know how to post on facebook, so I am 
sending this file to all the Triple Deucers I have 
in my address book. I was very honored to at-
tend Smitty's funeral and represent his combat 
brothers. I think it was a comfort to the family to 
have someone attend from that period of his life. 
I hope I don't have to attend any others for a 
long, long time. 
Sorry if you received it twice. 
  

Deeds not Words  
Andrew Diffley 

302-547-0477 
D Co.& A .Cos. 25th ID, May 1969 to June 1970 

 

 
 
 

 

mailto:jannnonble@aol.com
mailto:godfaith66@aol.com
mailto:hronald55@hotmail.com
mailto:tlupei@yahoo.com
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